
TOWNSHIP OF WRIGHTSTOWN 
 

 ORDINANCE NO._______            
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWNSHIP OF WRIGHTSTOWN, 
COUNTY OF BUCKS, COMMONWEALTH OF 
PENNSYLVANIA ADOPTING THE 2018 EDITION OF THE 
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AND REPEALING ALL 
ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF THE ORDINANCES IN 
CONFLICT THEREWITH, OTHER THAN WRIGHTSTOWN 
TOWNSHIP ORDINANCE NO. 143 CONCERNING FIRE 
SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS.  

 
WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors is authorized to adopt standard or nationally 

recognized codes by reference pursuant to Section 1601(e) of the Second Class Township Code, 53 
P.S. Section 66601(e); and  

  
WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of Wrightstown has determined that it is in the best 

interest of the residents and property owners in the Township of Wrightstown to adopt the 2018 
Edition of the International Fire Code. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of Wrightstown Township does hereby 

enact and ordain the following: 
 
Section 1.  Chapter 7 Fire Prevention and Fire Protection shall be amended by inserting a 
new Part 3 as follows: 
 
Part 3 Wrightstown Fire Code 
 
§7-301  Adoption of standards. 
 

The International Fire Code, 2018 Edition including all appendices, as amended, one copy of 
which is on file in the office of the Code Official and the Township of Wrightstown, being marked 
and designated as the International Fire Code, as published by the International Code Council, is 
hereby adopted as the Fire Code of Wrightstown Township for regulating and governing the 
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling 
and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or 
property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the Township of Wrightstown except for one 
and two family dwellings and providing for the issuance of permits for hazardous uses or operations; 
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of such International Fire Code, 
2018 Edition, published by the International Code Council on file in the office of the Code Official 
are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this chapter, with the 
following amendments and additions. 
 
§7-302  Amendments, Deletions and Additions. 
 
The following sections of are hereby revised as follows: 
 



 
 

 
 2 

 1. Section 101.1 is amended to insert “Township of Wrightstown, Bucks County, 
Pennsylvania” 
 
 2. Section 102.5 is deleted in its entirety. 
 
 3. Section 109.4 is added as follows: 
 
  109.4 Other Circumstances. Should the Township opt not to create a Fire Code 

Board of Appeals, the first level of appeal shall be to the Fire Inspector.  Any appeal of the 
decision of the Fire Inspector shall be to the Wrightstown Township Building Code Board of 
Appeals.  All appeals beyond the Building Code Board of Appeals shall be to the Court of 
Common Pleas of Bucks County. 

 
 4. Section 110.4 is amended to read as follows: 
 
  110.4 Violation Penalties.  Persons who shall violate a provision of this Code or 

shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, 
repair or do any work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 
code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code, shall be 
guilty of a summary offense, punishable by a fine not to exceed $1,000.00 or by 
imprisonment not exceeding 90 days, or both such fine and imprisonment.  Each day that a 
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.   

 
 5. Section 112.4 is amended to read as follows: 
 
  112.4 Failure to comply.  Any person who shall continue any work after having 

been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to 
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than twenty-five 
dollars ($25) or more than one thousand dollars ($1,000).  

 
 6. Section 1103.5.3 is amended to read as follows: 
 
  1103.5.3 Group I-2, Condition 2.  In addition to the requirements of Section 1103.5.2, 

existing buildings of Group I-2, Condition 2 occupancy shall be equipped throughout with an 
approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.  The automatic 
sprinkler system shall be installed within ninety (90) days. 

 
 7. The geographical limits referred to in certain sections of the Fire Code of 

Wrightstown Township are hereby established as follows: 
 

a. Section 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. 
Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings 
shall be in accordance with the latest edition of the National Fire Protection 



 
 

 
 3 

Association Codes, Standards, and Guides, and all applicable local, state, and 
federal laws, ordinances, and regulations. 

 
b. Section 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. 

Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks shall be in accordance 
with the latest edition of the National Fire Protection Association Codes, 
Standards, and Guides, and all applicable local, state, and federal laws, 
ordinances, and regulations. 

 
c. Section 5806.2 Limitations.  Limits for the storage of flammable cryogenic 

fluids in stationary containers shall be in accordance with the latest edition of 
the National Fire Protection Association Codes, Standards, and Guides, and 
all applicable local, state, and federal laws, ordinances, and regulations. 

 
d. Section 6104.2 Maximum capacity within established limits.  Limits for 

the storage of liquefied petroleum gas in heavily populated or congested 
areas shall be in accordance with the latest edition of the National Fire 
Protection Association Codes, Standards, and Guides, and all applicable 
local, state, and federal laws, ordinances, and regulations. 

 
§7-303  Establishment of an Annual Inspection Program 
 
 Pursuant to the 2018 International Fire Code §107 Inspections, all of the following Uses, 
as identified within the 2018 International Building Code, Chapter 3 – Occupancy Classification 
and Use, within Wrightstown Township shall be inspected by the Fire Code Official or other 
appointed individuals on an Annual basis. 
 
Uses identified as follows: 
 
Assembly: A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, A-5 
Business: All Business Uses 
Educational: All Educational Uses 
Factory: All Factory Uses 
High Hazard: H-1, H-2, H-2, H-4, H-5 
Institutional: I-1, I-2, I-3, I-4 
Mercantile: All Mercantile Uses 
Residential: R-1, R-2, R-3 (except one and two family dwellings). R-4 
Storage: S-1, S-2 
Utility: All Utility Uses (except when associated with one and two family dwellings) 
 
§7-304  Fees 
 
 Fees for the annual inspection program shall be established from time to time by the 



 
 

 
 4 

Board of Supervisors. 
 
Section 2.   That all ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed except 
for Wrightstown Township Ordinance No. 143 dealing with the installation of sprinklers for fire 
protection.  If a conflict exists between the terms of this ordinance, the 2018 International Fire Code 
and/or Ordinance No. 143, the most restrictive terms shall control.   
 

Section 3.    That nothing in this ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to 
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or 
any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as 
cited in Section 2 of this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be 
lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance. 
 
Section 4. If any provision of this Ordinance is declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to 
be invalid or unconstitutional, such determination shall have no effect on the remaining provisions of 
this Ordinance or on the provisions of the Code of Ordinances of Wrightstown Township. 

 
Section 5.  It is the intent of the Board of Supervisors of Wrightstown that the provisions of this 
Ordinance shall become and be made a part of the Code of the Township.  Sections of this Ordinance 
may be renumbered or relettered and the word “ordinance” may be changed to “section” or “article” 
or such other appropriate word or phrase in order to accomplish the intention of the Board of 
Supervisors. 

 
Section 6.   That this ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and 
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect five (5) days 
after adoption by the Board of Supervisors of Wrightstown Township. 

 
DULY ENACTED AND ORDAINED this              day of                                      , 2024, by 

the Township of Wrightstown in public session duly assembled.  
       

       
      WRIGHTSTOWN TOWNSHIP 

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
ATTEST: 
 
________________________  ____________________________  
Stacey Mulholland    Chester S. Pogonowski, Chair 
Township Manager  
 
      ____________________________ 

Jane B. Magne, Vice Chair 
 

 



 
 

 
 5 

____________________________ 
Robert S. Lloyd, Member 


